


























































Decision
Exposure

Rate
mR/hr

Incident
Zones

Activities Total
Accumulated
Stay Time for
First 12 Hours

Background Uncontrolled No restrictions. The best location for Incident
Command and decontamination activities.

Unlimited

< 10 Low-
Radiation
Zone
< 10 -100
mR/hr

If feasible, restrict access to essential personnel.
Initial decontamination of first responders should
occur near the outer boundary of this area.
Uninjured personnel within this zone at the time
of the RDD explosion can be directed to proceed
directly home to shower if resources do not
permit contamination surveying at the scene. (For
RDDs containing up to ~1000 Ci, this may be the
only zone that exists.)

Full 12 Hours

100 Medium-
Radiation
Zone
100-1000
mR/hr

Restrict access to only authorized personnel.
Personal dosimetry should be worn. Serves as a
buffer zone/transition area between the High and
Low radiation zones. People within this zone at
the time of the explosion should be surveyed for
contamination before being released. (For RDDs
up to ~ 10,000 Ci, this may be the highest
radiation zone that exists.)

5 - 12 Hours
(12 hours for
critical
property and
life saving
activities)



1000 High-
Radiation
Zone
1000 -
<10,000
mR/hr

Restrict access to authorized personnel with
specific critical tasks such as fire fighting,
medical assistance, rescue, extrication, and other
time sensitive activities. Personal dosimetry
should be worn. People within this zone at the
time of the explosion should be surveyed for
contamination before being released.

30 minutes –
5 Hours

10,000 Extreme
Caution Zone
= 10,000
mR/hr

This area, located within the High radiation zone,
is restricted to the most critical activities, such as
lifesaving. Personal dosimetry required, although
one monitor for several responders is acceptable
if they remain near the person with the monitor.
Limit time spent in this area to avoid Acute
Radiation Sickness. People within this zone at the
time of the explosion must be surveyed for
contamination before being released.

Minutes to a
few hours
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Dose Guidelines and Turn Back Exposure Rates

Activities Suggested turn-back
exposure rates

Guidelines for total
accumulated dose

Increased
Cancer Risk 4,5

Emergency worker
dose limit

Follow Radiation
Safety Officer

instructions

5,000 mrem1 0.4 %

Non-lifesaving
activities (major
critical property
protection)

10,000 mR/hr 10,000 mrem 0.8 %

Lifesaving activities 200,000 mR/hr2

Extreme Caution
50,000 mrem 3 4 %


















